MacKay, Eleanor

Subject: FW: 499 Cushing Quote

From: Chris Brennan <chrisbrennan7 @gmail.com>
Sent: Tuesday, February 7, 2023 6:39 PM

To: MacKay, Eleanor <mackaye@hingham-ma.gov>
Subject: Re: 499 Cushing Quote

eleanor,

our quote to remove the rear of kitchen cabinet and replace same after plumber is finished

$1475.00 to include labor and materials.

let me know if this works

chris

On Tue, Feb 7, 2023 at 9:18 AM MacKay, Eleanor <mackaye@hingham-ma.gov> wrote:

Thank you Chris, that’s great

From: Chris Brennan <chrisbrennan7 @gmail.com>
Sent: Tuesday, February 7, 2023 9:11 AM

To: MacKay, Eleanor <mackaye@hingham-ma.gov>
Subject: Re: 499 Cushing Quote

eleanor,



i will get you a quote for that today

just checking up on prevailing rate

chris

On Mon, Feb 6, 2023 at 12:35 PM MacKay, Eleanor <mackaye@hingham-ma.gov> wrote:

Hi Chris,

How are you? I hope all is well.

Would you please provide a quote to open up the back of the kitchen cabinets and replace them once the
plumber repairs the pipe. While the bathroom sink drain was working the other day, it isn’t anymore so we
are definitely going ahead with this work. Please use prevailing rate.

Thank you

FEleanor

Town of Hingham Massachusetts

Eleanor MacKay, RA

Land Use & Development
210 Central Street
Hingham, MA 02043
(781) 804-2314

mackave@hingham-ma.gov




South Shore Home Improvements

for all your home repairs and improvements.

Ph: 781 518 1788



